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Retirement is a time to relax, enjoy life, and pursue your passions. For
many people, travel is a top priority. But what if you're on a budget? Or if
you're not sure where to start? In their new book, Two Seniors And Year of
Slow Travel On Budget, authors John and Mary Smith share their inspiring
story of how they traveled the world for a year on a budget of just \$20,000.

John and Mary are both in their early 70s. They've been married for over 50
years and have always loved to travel. But when they retired, they realized
that they didn't have the money to travel the way they wanted to. So they
decided to try slow travel.

Slow travel is a style of travel that emphasizes quality over quantity. It's
about taking the time to experience a place, rather than rushing from one
destination to the next. John and Mary traveled by train, bus, and ferry.
They stayed in hostels, guesthouses, and even camped out in their car.
They ate at local restaurants and shopped at local markets. And they made
friends with people from all over the world.

Two Seniors And Year of Slow Travel On Budget is a heartwarming and
inspiring account of John and Mary's journey. It's filled with practical tips,
beautiful photography, and personal anecdotes that will inspire you to make
your own travel dreams a reality.

What You'll Learn from Two Seniors And Year of Slow Travel On
Budget

In Two Seniors And Year of Slow Travel On Budget, you'll learn:

FREE

https://newspaper.dimowa.com/read-book.html?ebook-file=eyJjdCI6Imw4UFBDTGJaR3lLQklJRFdmaFdwOWZqckdoWGpJek1qYUxRYkVqUXdXRUlRXC9xV2t0TU5XMndSNnlOSjdxdzNPbVU2eTVQcUFsaG81UFJub1BOQWlzT1ZNc0s1TWhFOUY4Q1YzVEp1NWN0OGhLbFJ3RDNLdmNweUo5OXBCZ0VJdDVrSmVXb1RHU0Iwd25HNGxONUYrY3doR0l6TXhNenZaVjJZOFNlbm5lMG5aUVNEbWN0TzlhODRkRkxoM2hXNjhMVGhnamRNVTVMNU1pZEpWODdFbXVRPT0iLCJpdiI6ImUzNjk1NDU1OTcxZmY0YTU3MzE1MGJlNzZlNzljOWQ2IiwicyI6IjczZTU0NzE0ZmIwZjExNTYifQ%3D%3D


How to plan a slow travel trip

How to budget for slow travel

How to choose the right destinations for slow travel

How to get the most out of your slow travel experiences

How to make friends while slow traveling

Two Seniors And Year of Slow Travel On Budget is a must-read for anyone
who dreams of traveling the world on a budget. It's a practical guide, an
inspiring story, and a beautiful keepsake that you'll cherish for years to
come.

Free Download Your Copy of Two Seniors And Year of Slow Travel On
Budget Today

Two Seniors And Year of Slow Travel On Budget is available now on Our
Book Library.com and other online retailers. Free Download your copy
today and start planning your own slow travel adventure.

Free Download Two Seniors And Year of Slow Travel On Budget on Our
Book Library.com

About the Authors

John and Mary Smith are two seniors who have been married for over 50
years. They have always loved to travel, and in their retirement, they
decided to try slow travel. They traveled the world for a year on a budget of
just \$20,000, and they wrote about their experiences in their book, Two
Seniors And Year of Slow Travel On Budget.



John and Mary are passionate about helping other seniors make their
travel dreams a reality. They offer workshops, presentations, and
consultations on slow travel. They also maintain a blog where they share
their travel tips and experiences.

You can learn more about John and Mary and their book on their website:
www.twoseniorstravel.com.
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